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First Interim Analysis of PROSPER Study Details Patient-Reported Symptom Burden 

of Mycosis Fungoides and Sézary Syndrome 

 

Findings spotlighted in oral presentation at the 5th annual World Congress of Cutaneous 
Lymphomas meeting in Pasadena, CA 

 
Tokyo, Japan, 15 April 2024 – On Friday, 12th April, 2024, Professor Julia Scarisbrick of University of 
Birmingham presented interim findings from the Kyowa Kirin, Inc. (Kyowa Kirin, TSA: 4151)-
sponsored study, “Real-World Observational Study of Mogamulizumab in Adult Patients with Mycosis 
Fungoides and Sézary Syndrome (PROSPER)”, a prospective observational study evaluating the 
real-world impact of mogamulizumab on disease symptoms and health-related quality of life (HRQoL) 
in patients with these subtypes of cutaneous T-cell lymphoma (CTCL). 
 
CTCL is a rare form of non-Hodgkin lymphoma that most prominently affects the skin, presenting as 
patches, plaques, tumours, or reddening of the entire skin, and may be associated with severe 
itching. In a proportion of cases, the disease may spread to the lymph nodes, blood, and/or other 
organs. 
 
In the current interim analysis, symptom scores (mean) were reported for 20 adult patients with 
relapsed or refractory disease (8 MF; 12 SS) over their first 16 weeks of mogamulizumab treatment. 
Prior to treatment initiation, patients reported their symptom burden using a 1 – 10 numeric scale. At 
baseline, skin itch scored highest (6.6) followed by skin redness (6.2), flaking skin (5.9) and skin pain 
(4.0). Additionally, over half of patients reported having sleep problems either “frequently” or “every 
night” while 47% reported difficulties regulating body temperature “frequently” or “always”. 
 
Improvement in all symptoms was reported within 4 weeks of treatment initiation and by week 16, 
symptom severity had decreased considerably with the greatest improvement seen in skin redness (-
2.9) closely followed by skin itch (-2.7), flaking skin (-2.5) and skin pain (-2.2). Of note, the proportion 
of patients reporting sleep problems or difficulties regulating body temperature either “frequently” or 
“always” decreased to less than 20%. 
 
“We know that CTCL patients not only suffer from the stress of a cancer diagnosis, but that these 
stresses are compounded by painful, red, scaly, and itchy lesions, tumours, and varying levels of 
discomfort,” says study principal investigator, Prof. Julia Scarisbrick of the University of Birmingham. 
“The PROSPER study is helping us understand these burdens better and the impact mogamulizumab 
may have on patients’ symptoms and quality of life.” 
 
About PROSPER 
The objective of the PROSPER (ClinicalTrials.gov ID NCT05455931) study is to gain insight into the 
experiences of patients with MF/SS receiving mogamulizumab and of their caregivers in real-world 
clinical practice through the collection of patient reported outcomes (PRO) data, enriched with 
qualitative data on disease and treatment experience and burden. The study was designed with input 
from patients and caregivers to ensure patient-relevant outcomes were selected. The study is being 
conducted in up to 6 countries across North America, Europe, and the Middle East, at 19 sites known 
to treat and follow-up patients with MF/SS. Patients are followed for up to 50 weeks from study 
enrolment. 
 
About Poteligeo® (mogamulizumab) 

Mogamulizumab is a first-in-class humanised monoclonal antibody (mAb) directed against CC 

chemokine receptor 4 (CCR4), a protein consistently expressed in both MF and SS;1,2,3 once 

mogamulizumab binds to CCR4, it increases attraction of immune cells from the immune system to 

destroy the cancerous cells.4  
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About Mycosis Fungoides (MF) and Sézary Syndrome (SS) 

MF and SS are two subtypes of CTCL,5 which is itself a rare form of non-Hodgkin lymphoma that 

presents and persists in the skin.5,6 CTCL is treatable, but is not generally considered to be curable, 

and there has been a clear unmet need for novel treatment options. As well as the obvious impact of 

symptoms upon patients, there can be significant erosions to quality of life for those caring for an 

individual living with CTCL.7  

 

MF and SS are characterised by localisation of cancerous white blood cells called T lymphocytes (T 

cells), to the skin.8,9 These cancerous T cells consistently express a protein called CC-chemokine 

receptor 4 (CCR4), which enables them to move from the blood to the skin.1,2,3 When these cancerous 

T cells move to the skin this results in the visible early skin symptoms of red patches or plaques 1,10,11,12,13 

which can resemble psoriasis or eczema in the early stages of the disease.8 Later, for some patients, 

skin involvement may evolve to include tumours or reddening of the majority of the skin surface 

(erythroderma). 

 

MF – the most common CTCL subtype – accounts for approximately 60% of all CTCLs10 and is typically 

indolent, characterised by skin symptoms including patches or plaques, skin redness and tumours.14 

SS is much rarer, accounting for around 5% of CTCLs,15 and is more aggressive,8 with high levels of 

blood involvement.16 It can cause severe itching, erythroderma, intense scaling of the skin and frequent 

hair loss.10  

 

MF and SS, while presenting in skin, can for some patients also affect the blood, lymph nodes (part of 

the body’s immune system which is spread throughout the body) and internal organs.17 All four areas 

of the body are used to assess disease stage18,19 and clinically significant involvement of the blood, 

particularly in more advanced disease, has been linked with increased morbidity and an overall 

reduction in patient survival.14, 18,20, 

 

CTCL can take, on average, between 2 and 7 years for individuals to receive a confirmed diagnosis.21 

Therefore, it is important for doctors to consider CTCL as an early differential diagnosis as the patient’s 

prognosis can be affected if the disease progresses to later stages.22 Whilst most individuals that 

present with early stage disease do not progress more severely,23 patients with advanced disease have 

significantly poorer outcomes with only around half of patients (52%) surviving for just 5 years.18 CTCL 

is an ultra-rare disease that affects 0.7 per 100,000 patients across the UK.24 The annual incidence of 

MF in Europe is estimated to be between 1 in 110,000 to 1 in 350,000.25 The annual incidence of SS is 

1 in 10,000,000.26 Together they represent approximately 65% of all cases of CTCL.17  

 

About Kyowa Kirin  

Kyowa Kirin strives to create and deliver novel medicines with life-changing value. As a Japan based 

Global Specialty Pharmaceutical Company with a more than 70-year heritage, the company applies 

cutting-edge science including an expertise in antibody research and engineering, to address the needs 

of patients and society across multiple therapeutic areas including Nephrology, Oncology, 

Immunology/Allergy and Neurology. Across our four regions – Japan, Asia Pacific, North America and 

EMEA/International – we focus on our purpose, to make people smile, and are united by our shared 

values of commitment to life, teamwork, innovation, and integrity. 
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